
 

“Do everything in Love” 1Corinthians 16:14 

 

22nd March 2024 
Forest Church 
This week, Saplings children were treated to a Forest 
Church session, led by Barbara and Rev. Lynette. The 
children enjoyed getting changed into their 
waterproofs and heading up to St Mary’s churchyard 
for their outdoor worship. There was even time for us 
to say hello to the donkeys first! 

Barbara spoke to the children about the beauty of the 
world around us and how important it is for us all to 
look after God’s creation. We all reflected on times 
when we may have not looked after it and said a quiet 
sorry then thought about how “we can do it!” 
 

The children made a cross from twigs and twine as a 
symbol of God and His creation and a reminder for us 
all to do our part and look after His beautiful world.  
 
Mrs Daniels and I would like to thank all the parents 
who gave their time to help Saplings. We hope that 
you enjoyed it.  
 

Upcoming School Dates for Your Diary 

28th March Last day of term 

15th April Start of Term 5 

 
 
 
 
 
 

PTA Pamper Night 
The PTA pamper night was a terrific success, raising a 
whopping £714.84.  
 
Thank you so much to all those who showed their 
support by purchasing a raffle ticket, having a 
treatment from our great therapists or for popping in 
to enjoy a glass of fizz and taking the time to browse 
our fabulous stalls. 
 
A huge thank you to the pamper team for all 
your hard work in setting up and running this event to 
raise money which will benefit our lovely children.   
 
Elms Toy Museum 
Here are some lovely photos following on from last 
weeks’ Toy Museum in Elms Class. 

 
Measles 
NHS Kent and Medway is encouraging parents and 
carers to download the NHS toolkit for five to 11-year-
olds.  
 
https://www.kmhealthandcare.uk/application/files/1
817/0626/5038/NHS_toolkit_for_primary_school_chil
dren.pdf 
 
This digital booklet has useful information about 
where to go for health help and advice on common 
childhood health problems. It also has information 
about looking after your child’s mental health and 
vaccinations, including the Measles, Mumps and 
Rubella (MMR) vaccine. 
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